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Resolution No. 35-26

The Logan County Board of Commissioners met in regular open session on this date of February 10, 2026, with
full board present.

Mr. Greg Fitzpatrick moved that the following resolution be adopted:

RE: AWARD BID FOR BRIDGE CR 39-6.80 SUPERSTRUCTURE REPLACEMENT-
ENGINEER

WHEREAS, bids were received electronically on February 5, 2026, for Bridge CR 39-6.90 Superstructure
Replacement, and

WHEREAS, the Logan County Engineer has reviewed the bid and recommends awarding the bid to the sole
bidder Prestress Services Industries of Chio, LLC., 3400 Southwest Blvd., Grove City, Ohio, 43123 in the amount of
$264,600.00 and enter into a contract for the same.

THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED, by the Logan County Board of County Commissioners to award
the sole bidder Prestress Services Industries of Ohio, LLC, 3400 Southwest Blvd., Grove City, Ohio, 43123 in the amount
of $264,6400.00 and enter into a contract for the same.

Mr. Michael E. Yoder seconded the motion.

Roll call resulted as follows:

Mr. Jbe AntramgPresident 5
S S

Mr. Gp#g Fitzpatii€k, Vice President

Mr. Michael E. Yé&der, Member v

I, De De Doss, Clerk/Administrator, hereby certify this to be a true copy of the proceedings as taken from the
minutes of the meeting of the Logan County Commissioners on this date of February 10, 2026.

ige De Doss, Administrative Clerk




OFFICE OF THE

LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER

P.O. BOX 427

1991 COUNTY ROAD 13
BELLEFONTAINE, OH 43311

SCOTT C. COLEMAN, P.E., P.S.
LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER

February 6, 2026

Logan County Commissioners

www.lceo.us

Telephone: (937) 592-2791
Fax: (937) 599-2658

APPROYED BY THE BOARD OF
LOGAN COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100 MOTION 7 c—
Bellefontaine, OH 43311 2D '/M :‘\/ :gi"; ]‘)\

PER RESOLUTIONg, D2 ‘AL
Re:  Bid for Bridge CR 39 — 6.80 Superstructure Replacement DATED ! (0|

10:30 A.M., Thursday, February

5,2026

I have reviewed the lone bid which was received and opened in your office at the above date and time.
The bid appears to be in order meeting all specifications. The bid is as follows:

Base Bid Alternate Bid |
Company Amount Amount Delivery Date
Prestress Services Industries of Ohio, LLC $ 264,600 No Bid J ~July 14%, 2026

Therefore, I am recommending that your honorable board adopt a resolution awarding the Base Bid to
Prestress Services Industries of Ohio, LLC, 3400 Southwest Blvd. Grove City, OH, 43123, in the amount
of Two Hundred Sixty-Four Thousand, Six Hundred Dollars and No Cents ($ 264,600.00) and enter into a

contract for same.

In accordance with ORC 9.24, we have checked the Auditor of State’s Unresolved Findings for Recovery
and Prestress Services Industries of Ohio, LLC, was not listed and we have retained the certified search

confirmation page in the project file.
Respectfully submitted,

At fl——

Scott C. Coleman, P.E., P.S.
Logan County Engineer

SCC/sj

cc: File



General Info

Total:
$264,600.00

Number

CR 39-6.80 REPLACEMENT
Deadline

02/05/2026 10:30 AM EST
Vendor

Prestress Services Industries of Ohio, LLC
Submitted

02/03/2026 01:41 PM EST
Signed by

David Szydlik

Opened

02/05/2026 10:35 AM EST By
sjudd@lceo.us

Description

Furnishing and installing a prestressed bridge superstructure and related

material.

Allows zero unit prices and labor
Yes
Allows negative unit prices and labor

Yes
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ATTACHMENT LIST

BR C 39-6.80 Bid Package.pdf (978 KB)
BR C 39-6.80 NFB.pdf (184 KB)
BR C 39-6.80 Plans.pdf (1.63 MB)

PrevailingWages_01212026.pdf (292 KB}
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ADDENDUM

Addendum Acknowledgement: (Click "+" to add additional fields) (Type "N/A" if not applicable)
Addendum Number: *

N/A

Addendum Date: *

N/A
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AFFIDAVIT - CAMPAIGN CONTRIBUTIONS

Ohio Revised Code Section 3517.13(l) requires that no agency or department of this state or any political
subdivision shall award any contract, other than one let by competitive bidding or a contract incidental to
such contract or which is by force account, for the purchase of goods costing more than five hundred
dollars or services costing more than five hundred dollars to any individual, partnership, association,
including, without limitation, a professional association organized under Chapter 1785 of the ORC, estate,
or trust if the individual has made or the individual's spouse has made, or any partner, shareholder,
administrator, executor, or trustee or the spouse of any of them has made, as an individual, within the two
previous calendar years, one or more contributions totaling in excess of one thousand dollars to the holder
of the public office having ultimate responsibility for the award of the contract or to the public officer’'s
campaign committee. Furthermore, Ohio Revised Code Section 3517.13(J) requires that no agency or
department of this state or any political subdivision shall award any contract, other than one let by
competitive bidding or a contract incidental to such contract or which is by force account, for the purchase
of goods costing more than five hundred dollars or services costing more than five hundred dollars to a
corporation or business trust, except a professional association organized under Chapter 1785 of the ORC,
if an owner of more than twenty per cent of the corporation or business trust or the spouse of that person
has made, as an individual, within the two previous calendar years, taking into consideration only owners
for all of that period, one or more contributions totaling in excess of one thousand dollars to the holder of a
public office having ultimate responsibility for the award of the contract or to the public officer's campaign
committee. Execution of this proposal on the signature portion thereof shall constitute also signature of this
Campaign Contributions Affidavit.
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AFFIDAVIT - NON-COLLUSION

In accordance with Title 23 United States Code, Section 112 and Ohio Revised Code, Chapter 1331 et. seq: and Sections 2921.11
and 2921.13, the bidder hereby states, under penalty of perjury and under other such penalties as the law provides, that he or his
agents or employees have not entered either directly or indirectly into any agreement, participated in any collusion, or otherwise
taken any action in restraint of free competitive bidding in connection with this propasal. Execution of this proposal on the
signature portion thereof shall constitute also signature of this Non-Collusion Affidavit.
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PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX

ONE OF THE FOUR FOLLOWING COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT TABS MUST BE
COMPLETED.
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
: ss:

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" for the year and fill in
zero dollars for each remaining field if this section does not apply):

YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *
No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *

No bid

Title: *
No bid
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - SOLE PROPRIETORSHIP
DBA

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
. ss:

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

No bid

of: *

No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" for the year and fill in
zero dollars for each remaining field if this section does not apply):

YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *
No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *

No bid

Title: *
No bid
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - PARTNERSHIP

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE OF OHIO:
: ss:

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,
Ohio, and that:

No bid

known as: *

No bid

The business address of the bidder is: *

No bid

Telephone: *
No bid

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *
No bid

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" for the year and fill in
zero dollars for each remaining field if this section does not apply):

YEAR: * AMOUNT: * PENALTY: * INTEREST: *
No bid No bid No bid No bid

Signature: *
No bid

Title: *
No bid
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COMPETITIVE BIDDER'S PERSONAL PROPERTY TAX AFFIDAVIT - CORPORATION

Optional: Vendor is not required to complete.

STATE COF OHIOC:
. 88!

LOGAN COUNTY :

The undersigned, being duly sworn, says that he is or represents a competitive bidder doing business in, or with Logan County,

Ohio, and that:

[v|He is a duly authorized officer of the corporation

*

named: *

Prestress Services Industries of Ohio, LLC

The business address of the bidder is: *

3400 Southwest Blvd, Grove City, OH 43123

Telephone: *
(859) 402-6063

The undersigned further says that the bidder at the time of submitting his or its bid: *

Was not charged with any delinquient personal taxes in Logan County, Chio.

Delinquent Property Taxes As Follows (click "+" to create additional entries. Type "N/A" for the year and fill in
zero dollars for each remaining field if this section does not apply):

YEAR: *
N/A

Signature: *

David Szydlik

Title: *

Vice President Bridge Sales

AMOUNT: *
$.00

PENALTY: *
$.00

Page 10 of 15
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BIDDER INFORMATION

Company *

Prestress Services Industries of Ohio, LLC

Submitted by *
David Szydlik

Street, Post Office, City, State and Zip: *
3400 Southwest Blvd, Grove City, OH 43123-2242

E-Mail *

dszydlik@prestressservices.com

Telephone *
(859) 402-6063

Federal Tax ID# *
45-2515264

Page 11 of 15
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ITEM LIST

$264,600.00

Item Code

515

516

517

Description Quantity

Design,

Fabricate, Deliver

& Erect Bridge SIS
Superstructure

Design,

Fabricate, Deliver 1 LS
& Place Bearing

Pads

Design,

Fabricate, and

Deliver Bridge T LS
Railing

Units

Page 12 of 15

Unit Price

$229,600.00

$7,000.00

$28,000.00

Extension

$229,600.00

$7,000.00

$28,000.00

Total: $264,600.00
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REQUIRED DOCUMENTS LIST

Name

Paper Bid Bond, Certified Check, Cashier's

Check
Please upload a copy of your paper bid bond
here.

Ohio workers’ compensation certificate of
coverage
Submitted prior to contract execution

2 Required Documents

Omission Terms

| have electronically verified my bid bond in the
"Bid Bond" section above.

| will furnish prior to contract award

Page 13 of 15

Submitted
File

026 02-05
Logan County
bond.pdf

Prestress BWC
Cert 7.1.25 -
7.1.26.pdf
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BID GUARANTY

As specified in the Ohio Revised Code 153.54, a bidder must submit a bid guaranty in the form of either:

(1) a paper contract bond for the full amount (100%}) of the bid, or

(2) a certified check, cashier's check, or letter of credit in the amount of 10% of the bid.

Bond Percentage

10.00%

[v]l understand that original, wet-ink bid guaranty documents will be received “within three days post bid
deadline.”

*

Paper Bid Bond, Certified Check, Cashier's Check, Letter of Credit, or Paper Contract Bond

Confirmation *

| have provided a Contract Bond for 100.00% of the bid total amount and have uploaded a
copy in the Required Documents List at the bottom of this solicitation.

Field 3 Label *

N/A

Page 14 of 15
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BIDDERS CERTIFICATION:

The undersigned, being a duly authorized officer of the prime contract bidder, does hereby certify to and agree to all the
required contract provisions and documents outlined within the final plans, wage rates, utility notes, proposal notes, and
bidders notices each furnished in their entirety within the attachment list above.

The undersigned, being a duly autharized officer of the prime contract bidder, does hereby agrees to furnish all labor,
materials, and equipment for the (project listed in the general info section) and perform all work incident thereto in accordance
with the plans and specifications thereof and subject to the satisfaction and acceptance by the County Engineer at the unit
prices provided on the proceeding pages.

The undersigned, being a duly autharized officer of the prime contract bidder, does hereby agrees to enter into a contract
within ten (10) days; to complete the said improvement and will furnish the required bond for the payment of all bills for
damages, labor, and material arising from the construction of said improvement.

Signature of Authorized Officer: *

David Szydlik
Date: _/ [ [|*
02/03/26

Title: *

Vice President Bridge Sales
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BID GUARANTY AND
CONTRACT BOND

(SECTION 153.571 Ohio Revised Code)

KNOW ALL BY THESE PRESENTS, that we, the undersigned Prestress Services Industries of Ohio, LLC

3400 Southwest Boulevard, Grove City, OH 43123

(Name and Address)
as Principal and Western Surety Company

{Name of Surety)
as Surety,

are hereby held and firmly bound unto the Logan County Commissioners

as Obligee in the penal sum of the dollar amount

of the bid submitted by the Principal to the Obligee on February 5, 2026 to undertake the project known as:
Bridge Superstructure and Related Material

The penal sum referred to herein shall be the dollar amount of the Principal's bid to the Obligee, incorporating any additive or deductive
altemate proposals made by the Principal on the date referred to above to the Obligee, which are accepted by the Obligee. In no case shall the
penal sum exceed the amount of dollars ($ ). If the above line is left blank, the penal sum will be the full

amount of the Principal's bid, including alternates. Alternalively, if completed, the amount stated must not be less than the full amount of the
bid, including alternates, in dollars and cents. A percentage is not acceptable.) For the payment of the penal sum well and truly to be made, we
hereby jointly and severally bind ourselves, our heirs, executors, administrators, successors, and assigns.

THE CONDITION OF THE ABOVE OBLIGATION IS SUCH, that whereas the above named Principal has submitted a bid on the
above referred to project;

NOW, THEREFORE, if the Obligee accepts the bid of the Principal and the Principal fails to enter into a proper contract in accordance with
the bid, plans, details, specifications, and bills of material; and in the event the Principal pays to the Obligee the difference not to exceed ten
percent of the penalty hereof between the amount specified in the bid and such larger amount for which the Obligee may in good faith
contract with the next lowest bidder to perform the work covered by the bid; or in the event the Obligee does not award the contract to the
next lowest bidder and resubmits the project for bidding, the Principal will pay the Obligee the difference not to exceed ten percent of the
penalty hereof between the amount specified in the bid, or the costs, in connection with the resubmission, of printing new contract documents,
required advertising and printing and mailing notices to prospective bidders, whichever is less, then this obligation shall be null and void,
otherwise to remain in full force and effect. If the Obligee accepts the bid of the Principal and the Principal, within ten days after the awarding
of the contract, enters into a proper contract in accordance with the bid, plans, details, specifications, and bills of inaterial, which said contract
is made a part of this bond the same as though set forth herein; and

$-2057/GE 2/98 Page 1 of 2
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IF THE SAID Principal shall well and faithfully perform each and every condition of such contract; and indemnify the Obligee against
all damage suffered by failure to perform such contract according to the provisions thereof and in accordance with the plans, details,
specifications, and bills of material therefor; and shall pay all lawful claims of subcontractors, materialmen, and laborers, for labor performed
and materials furnished in the carrying forward, perfonming, or completing of said contract; we agreeing and assenting that this undertaking
shall be for the benefit of any materialman or laborer having a just claim; as well as for the Obligee herein; then this obligation shall be void;
otherwise the same shall remain in full force and effect; it being expressly understood and agreed that the liability of the Surety for any and all
claims hereunder shall in no event exceed the penal amount of this obligation as herein stated.

THE SAID Surety hereby stipulates and agrees that no modifications, omissions, or additions, in or to the terms of said contract or in or
to the plans and specifications therefor shall in any wise affect the obligations of said Surety on ils bond, and it does hereby waive notice of
any such modifications, omissions or additions to the terms of the contract or to the work or to the specifications.

SIGNED AND SEALED This 5th day of February . 2026

PRINCIPAL:

Prestress Services Industries of Ohio, LLC

BY:

TITLE:

SURETY: Western Surety Company SURETY COMPANY ADDRESS:

151 N. Franklin Street

(q}/ [(( / ///7/(], S;:itcago IL 60606

i i City State Zip
: me (312) 822-5000
Aﬂon Fact Telephone
SURETY AGENT'S ADDRESS:
AssuredPartners
Agency Name

5005 E. Galbraith Road. Suite 5000

Straet

Cincinnati OH 45236
City State Zip
(513) 475-3337

Telephone

NOTE: Failure by any party to sign Bid Guaranty and Contract Bond shall result in rejection of bid.
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Western Surety Company

POWER OF ATTORNEY APPOINTING INDIVIDUAL ATTORNEY-IN-FACT

Know All Men By These Presents, That WESTERN SURETY COMPANY, a South Dakota cotporation, is a duly organized and existing corporation having its
principal office in the City of Sioux Falls, and State of South Dakota, and that it does by virtue of the signature and seal herein affixed hereby make, constitute and appoint

Mark Nelson, Nancy Nemec, Gladys D Rogers, Tiffiany Gobich, Elizabeth Talbott, Kelsey Becker, Randal T Noah,
Tammy L Masterson, Julie Cline, Audria Coleman, Kathrine Krekeler, Meghan Schraer, Trinity Lukens, Individually

of Cincinnati, OH, its true and lawful Attorney(s)-in-Fact with full power and authority hereby conferred to sign, seal and execute for and on its behalf bonds,
undertakings and other obligatory instruments of sitilar nature

- In Unlimited Amounts -

and to bind it therehy as fully and to the same extent as if such instruments were signed by a duly authorized officer of the corporation and all the acts of said Attorney,
pursuant to the authority hereby given, are hereby ratified and confirmed.

This Power of Attorney is made and executed pursuant to and by authority of the Authorizing By-Laws and Resolutions printed at the bottom of this page, duly
adopted, as indicated, by the shareholders of the corporation,

In Witness Whereof, WESTERN SURETY COMPANY has caused these presents to be signed by its Vice President and its corporate seal to be hereto affixed on
this 11th day of December, 2025.

“\mmu,,,"”'

SR, WESTERN SURETY COMPANY

Q?OR 5%
Larry Kasten, Vice President

I[,"
(758
4’

AR,
EST
s

‘&m
S
&S s
s 8
s 5
;i
2

State of South Dakota }
County of Minnehaha

On this 11th day of December, 2025, before me personally came Larry Kasten, to me known, who, being by me duly sworn, did depose and say: that he resides in
the City of Sioux Falls, State of South Dakota; that he is a Vice President of WESTERN SURETY COMPANY described in and which executed the above instrument;
that he knows the seal of said corporation; that the seal affixed to the said instrument is such corporate seal; that it was so affixed pursuant to authority given by the Board
of Directors of said corporation and that he signed his name thereto pursuant to like authority, and acknowledges same to be the act and deed of said corporation.

My commission expires M. BENT §
NGTARY PUBLIC H E Z /
March 2, 2026 SOUTH ummg M
+ L

M. Bent, Notary Public
CERTIFICATE

1, Paula Kolsrud, Assistant Secretary of WESTERN SURETY COMPANY do hereby certify that the Power of Attorney hereinabove set forth is still in force, and
further certify that the By-Laws and Resolutions of the corporation ptinted below this certificate are still in force. In testimony whereof T have hereunto subscribed my
name and affixed the seal of the said corporation this 5th day of February , 2026 .

“.“uuuu,,,,
RET Y%,

WESTERN SURETY COMPANY

Ghube. Yolorud

Paula Kolsrud, Assistant Secretary

Authorizing By-Laws and Resolutions
ADOPTED BY THE SHAREHOLDERS OF WESTERN SURETY COMPANY
This Power of Attorney is made and executed pursuant to and by authority of the following By-Law duly adopted by the shareholders of the Company.

Section 7. All bonds, policies, undettakings, Powers of Attorney, or other obligations of the corporation shall be executed in the corporate name of the Company by
the President, Secretary, and Assistant Secretary, Treasuter, or any Vice President, or by such other officers as the Board of Directors may authorize. The President, any
Vice President, Secretary, any Assistant Secretary, or the Treasurer may appoint Attorneys in Fact or agents who shall have authority to issue bonds, policies, or
undertakings in the name of the Company. The corporate seal is not necessary for the validity of any bonds, policies, undertakings, Powers of Attorney or other
obligations of the corporation. The signature of any such officer and the corporate seal may be printed by facsimile,

This Power of Attomey is signed by Larry Kasten, Vice President, who has been authorized pursuant to the above Bylaw to execute power of attorneys on behalf of
‘Western Surety Company.

This Power of Attorney may be signed by digital sighature and sealed by a digital or otherwise electronic-formatted corporate seal under and by the anthority of the
following Resolution adopted by the Board of Directors of the Company by unanimous written consent dated the 27" day of April, 2022:

“RESOLVED: That it is in the best interest of the Company to periodically ratify and confirm any corporate documents signed by digital signatures and o ratify and
confirm the use of a digital or otherwise electronic-formatted corporate seal, each to be considered the act and deed of the Company.” .

Go to www.cnasurety.com > Owner / Obligee Services > Validate Bond Coverage, if you want to verify bond authenticity. '

Form F4280-8-2023




WESTERN SURETY COMPANY
Sioux Falls, South Dakota

Statement of Net Admitted Assets and Liabilities

December 31, 2024
ASSETS

Bonds
Stocks
Cash, cash equivalents, and short-term investments
Investment income due and accrued
Premiums and considerations
Amounts recoverable from reinsurers
Net deferred tax asset
Receivable from parent, subsidiaries, and affiliates
Other assets
Total Assets

LIABILITIES AND SURPLUS

Losses

Loss adjustment expense

Commissions payable, contingent commissions and other similar charges
Taxes, license and fees (excluding federal and foreign income taxes)
Federal and foreign income taxes payable

Unearned premiums

Advance premiums

Ceded reinsurance premiums payable (net of ceding commissions)
Amounts withheld or retained by company for account of others
Provision for reinsurance

Payable to parent, subsidiaries and affiliates

Other liabilities
Total Liabilities

Surplus Account:
Common stock $ 4,000,000
Gross paid in and contributed surplus 286,896,195
Unassigned funds _1,191,580,505

Surplus as regards policyholders
Total Liabilities and Capital

$ 1,977,426,497
14,281,828
55,103,010
17,819,818
84,144,805
(4,320,189)
18,694,198
11,631,758
580.232

§ 2,175,361,957

$ 264,641,145
56,935,932
13,946,448

4,432,923
711,402
339,078,542
6,415,557
2,586,994
3,710,405
387,964
5.975
31,970

$ 692,885,257

§  1.482.476.700

§  2,175361.957

I, Julie L{eg;ag\[,lce President of Western Surety Company hereby certify that the above is an accurate
repr@@‘e tﬁi‘éﬁ}e “the financial statement of the Company dated December 31, 2024, as filed with the

;;;;;;;;

vaﬂggs n a&,; i h dpartments and is a true and correct statement of the condltlon of Western Surety
thalz g

=

CompanA

Zimidy WESTERN SURETY COMPANY

=3
;‘.,’.3‘;93 F@

iE & % {I}'—: *
A £h SR By &J_b«ﬁ/ be%

T O o

i3, 24230492800 Y

Subscribed and sworn to me this __ 13th  dayof __ March
My commission expires:

YOLANDA JIMENEZ

My Commission Expires
[ lambar24, 202 y

o & o _
g gﬂ%;,%@,g? Vice Prgsident, Accounting Policy & External Reporting

e~ ,’ . - " £ o et _.I,I. B - ’, 2 X - ‘
‘2! QFFICIAL SEAL ; Y ! ’ Notary Public
i)’ Notary Public - State Of flinols &




Office of Risk Assessment Ohio Department of Insurance
50 West Town Street

Third Floor - Suite 300 Mike DeWine - Governor
Columbus,Ohio 43215 . hi
(614)644-2658 Judith French - Director
Fax(614)644 5250 Certificate of Compliance

www.insurance.ohio.gov

Issued  03/12/2025

Effective 04/02/2025

Expires 04/01/2026
I, Judith French, hereby certify that I am the Director of Insurance in the State of Ohio and have supervision of
insurance business in said State and as such Ihereby certify that

WESTERN SURETY COMPANY

of South Dakota is duly organized under the laws of this State and is authorized to transact the business of insurance
under the following section(s) of the Ohio Revised Code;

Section 3929.01 (A)
Fidelity

Other Liability
Surety

WESTERN SURETY COMPANY certified in its annual statement to this Depattment as of December 31, 2024 that
it has admitted assets in the amount of $2,175,361,957, liabilities in the amount of $692,885,257, and surplus of at
least $1,482,476,700.

IN WITNESS WHEREOF, I have hereunto subscribed my name and caused my seal to be affixed at Columbus, Ohio,
this day and date.

St L Bvtnet—

Judith French, Director

INS7230(Rev.6/2003) Accredited by the National Association of Insurance Commissioners (NAIC)




ompensation Columbus, OH 43215

Certificate of Ohio Workers' Compensation

This certifies that the employer listed below participates in the Ohio State Insurance Fund as required by law.
Therefore, the employer is entitled to the rights and benefits of the fund for the period specified. This certificate
is only valid if premiums and assessments, including installments, are paid by the applicable due date. To
verify coverage, visit www.bwc.ohio.gov, or call 1-800-644-62392.

‘Z?lﬁL'O‘I Bureau of Workers’ 30 W. Spring St.
- C
"

This certificate must be conspicuously posted.

Policy number and employer Period Specified Below
01629190 07/01/2025 to 07/01/2026

PRESTRESS SERVICES INDUSTRIES OF OH LLG"
435 COLUMBUS RD '
MOUNT VERNON OH 43050-4425

www .bwc.chio.gov
Issued by: BWG

Stphanic M llouel

Administrator/CEO

You can reproduce this certificate as needed.

Ohio Bureau of Workers' Compensation

Required Posting

Section 4123.54 of the Ohio Revised Code requires notice of
rebuttable presumption. Rebuttable presumption means an
employee may dispute or prove untrue the presumption (or
belief) that alcohol, marihuana or a controlled substance not
prescribed by the employee's physician is the proximate cause
(main reason) of the work-related injury.

The burden of proof is on the employee to prove the presence of
alcohol, marihuana or a controlled substance was not the
proximate cause of the work-related injury. An employee who
tests positive or refuses to submit to chemical testing may be
disqualified for compensation and benefits under the Workers'
Compensation Act.

<B' /ub’l Bureau of Workers’
i Com Pensatlon You must post this language with the Certificate of Ohio Workers' Compensation.
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